MEMORANDUM

TO: Sascha Marston
FROM: Jean Hersley

DATE: April 2, 2020

RE: Refund: overpayment

Please refund $25.

NAME: KIMBERLAND LLC
2275 MOZART CT
MERIDIAN ID 83646

RECEIPT #: W047866

Thank you.

Jean
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kIMBERLAND REFUND.doc

Hersley, Jean

Sent: Wednesday, April 01, 2020 12:51 PM
To: Financial

Attachments: kIMBERLAND REFUND.doc (32 KB)

Please process the attached refund. Thank you.

Jean

https://webmail.idwr.idaho.gov/owa/?ae=Item&t=IPM.Note&id=RgAAAAAPIWIVVYZSTZ... 4/2/2020
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Re: Ownership change for Kimberland LLC

Kenny Christensen [kbcinvestments@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 01, 2020 11:47 AM
To: Hersley, Jean

I think it was used for a mint still on the southwest corner of the property, but | don't have any further
documentation.

Thank you for working on the irrigation split and please let me know when it is complete.

Thank you

On Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 11:11 AM Hersley, Jean <Jean.Hersley@idwr.idaho.gov> wrote:
The Department of Water Resources is in the process of reviewing an ownership change
that was received in November, 2019. After looking at aerial photography and the water
right backfile, it doesn’t appear that the commercial use of this water right is appurtenant to
land now owned by Kimberland LLC. If you have any documentation that states otherwise, |
will split the irrigation use only. Please let me know as soon as possible. Thank you.

Jean Hersley

Technical Records Specialist Il
Idaho Dept Water Resources
(208) 287-4942

Kenny Christensen
Kimberland LL.C
kbcinvestments@gmail.com

https://webmail.idwr.idaho.gov/owa/?ac=Item&t=IPM.Note&id=RgAAAAAPIWOVWYZsTZ... 4/2/2020



